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Statement of Work

National Institute for Literacy

Technical Assistance to Update the Institute’s Website

I. 
Background

The National Institute for Literacy (Institute) was established to ensure that literacy would have a place on the federal policy agenda and to invigorate a national effort to improve adult literacy.  Its primary activities to strengthen literacy across the lifespan are authorized by the U.S. Congress under two laws, the Adult Education and Family Literacy Act (AEFLA) in the Workforce Investment Act and the No Child Left Behind Act (NCLB).  The AEFLA directs the Institute to provide national leadership regarding literacy, coordinate literacy services and policy, and serve as a national resource for adult education and literacy programs. The NCLB law directs the Institute to disseminate information on scientifically based reading research pertaining to children, youth, and adults as well as information about development and implementation of classroom reading programs based on the research.
The Institute’s authorizing laws organize its activities into four general areas: program improvement; policy and technical assistance; information dissemination, including dissemination of scientifically based reading research and effective reading programs based on scientific research; and coordination of research support.  To carry out these duties, the Institute has concentrated its efforts on projects that could bring about significant improvement across the adult education system and enhance the use of findings from scientific research in reading instruction for all ages.  Together, the Institute’s authorizing laws reinforce a focus on disseminating critical information on reading across the lifespan while allowing the Institute to address broader challenges associated with improving the effectiveness of the adult literacy service delivery system.  

The website is the Institute’s major dissemination vehicle for literacy research across the lifespan. The audience for the website includes teachers, administrators, policymakers, parents, students and others interested in scientifically based reading and literacy research. Visitors to the website not only read the material on the website, but also download materials from the site. 

II.   
Purpose of the Acquisition

The Institute seeks technical assistance to update text on the Institute’s website (www.nifl.gov) to provide more current, comprehensive information on its projects and activities.  After the initial revision, the Institute also seeks quarterly updates to keep the project information current and monthly updates to provide new information on the homepage on a regular basis.

III.   
Scope of Work

The contractor shall perform the following tasks and submit associated deliverables listed below.  

Task 1:  Participate in a post-award meeting with Institute staff.

1.1 The contractor shall attend a post-award meeting at the Institute’s offices in Washington, DC within 15 business days of the contract award to discuss contract tasks, timeline, and answer questions.

1.2 The contractor shall provide a written summary of the post-award meeting to Institute staff no later than 5 days after the conclusion of the post award meeting to be submitted via electronic mail.

Task 2:  Develop a work plan for updating the Institute website
2.1
The contractor shall prepare a work plan for updating the text on the Institute’s website that describes a comprehensive revision of the existing text on the website; quarterly updates following completion of the initial revision; and monthly updates to the homepage.  The scope of the workplan shall include all text about the Institute, its programs and services and related information, but exclude Fact Sheets and publications.  The workplan shall describe:

· changes to the amount, content, and style of text required to update and improve the website;

· the information required for the contractor to update the website and how the contractor proposes to gather it; and 

· a timeline.

2.2 
The contractor shall revise the work plan in response to Institute comments.

2.3 
The contractor shall submit the final work plan for Institute approval. 

Task 3:  Meet with the Institute’s website designer.

3.1
The contractor shall meet with the Institute’s website designer in person if the contractor is located in the Washington, DC area or by conference call to discuss the workplan approved in Task 2.3.

3.2
The contractor shall refine the workplan in response to discussions with the website designer.

Task 4:  Implement the comprehensive update of the Institute’s website

4.1 
The contractor shall draft text for the comprehensive update of the Institute’s website in accordance with the workplan approved in Task 2.3 and submit for Institute review.  If the contractor desires, the revised text may be submitted in portions.

4.2 
The contractor shall revise text in response to Institute comments.

4.3 The contractor shall submit revised text for Institute review.

4.4
The contractor shall make revisions in response to Institute comments from Task 4.3 and submit text for final approval. 

Task 5:  Draft quarterly updates to the Institute’s website.

5.1 
In accordance with the workplan approved in Task 2.3, the contractor shall draft quarterly updates to the Institute’s website and submit the text to the Institute for review.

5.2 
The contractor shall revise text in response to Institute comments and submit the text for final review.

Task 6:  Draft monthly updates to the Institute’s homepage.

6.1 
In accordance with the workplan approved in Task 2.3, the contractor shall draft text to update the Institute’s homepage each month and submit it for Institute review.

6.2 
The contractor shall revise text in response to Institute comments and submit it for final approval.

IV. Optional Tasks

Optional Task 1:  Draft quarterly updates to the Institute’s website.

1.1 
The contractor shall draft quarterly updates to the Institute’s website and submit the text to the Institute for review.

1.2 
The contractor shall revise text in response to Institute comments and submit the text for final review.

Optional Task 2:  Draft monthly updates to the Institute’s homepage.

2.1 
The contractor shall draft text to update the Institute’s homepage each month and submit it for Institute review.

2.2 
The contractor shall revise text in response to Institute comments and submit it for final approval.

VI. Schedule of Deliverables

	TASK
	DELIVERABLE
	DUE DATE

	Task 1.1
	Post Award Meeting Notes
	October 26, 2007

	Task 2.1
	Work plan
	November 20, 2007

	Task 2.2
	Revised Work plan
	December 7, 2007

	Task 3.2
	Revised Work plan     
	December 21, 2007

	Task 4.1
	Website text
	January 25, 2008

	Task 4.2
	Revised website text
	February 22, 2008

	Task 4.4
	Revised website text
	March 14, 2008

	Task 5.1
	Quarterly update text  
	June 2, 2008; September 1, 2008; December 1, 2008; March 1, 2009

	Task 5.2
	Revised quarterly update text 
	June 23, 2008; September 22, 2008; December 22, 2008; March 23, 2009

	Task 6.1
	Monthly homepage text
	The 15th of every month from April 15, 2008 through April 15, 2009

	Task 6.2 
	Revised monthly homepage text
	The 30th of every month from April 2008 through April 2009


VII. Performance Period

The performance period for this contract shall be 20 months from the time of contract award through April 30, 2009.  The Institute also may exercise an Optional year from May 1, 2009 through April 30, 2010.
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